
Agenda Item Summary

Description

Meeting Date(s): September 23, 2025

Category: Consent Subcategory: Procurement Solicitation

Contract Type: Invitation to Bid

Title: 25-0767-B-HD, Window Tinting & Graphic Lamination Services

Requestor: Facilities, Planning & Project Management

Vendor Name Amount Awarded Required Products/Services
B2K12 Branding Solutions, LLC
Carolina Premier Window Films, Inc.
JAG Window Tinting, Inc.
Suncoast Window Films
Wongsinee Kurtz dba Pro Tint of FL.

Variable Window Tinting and Graphic
Lamination Services

Total Variable

New Contract
New Contract Amount
Previous Contract Amount
Variance

Variable
N/A
N/A

Price Variance Explanation
Not Applicable

Discussion
The Office of Procurement Services issued an Invitation to Bid (ITB) on June 26,
2025. The intent of this ITB is to establish contracts with qualified vendors to
furnish and install  window film. The services will include; graphic lamination
window film, graphic design services, and standard window tinting for security,
aesthetics, and UV protection. 

The recommended contract amount is variable as projects will vary in size and
scope  and  may  be  implemented  through  District  offices  or  directly  through
schools. Projects will be implemented through District or school-based budgeted
funds.
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For projects less than or equal to $5,000.00, District staff may request a quote
from any one of the awarded vendors to perform the work.

For  projects  greater  than  $5,000.00  and  less  than  $200,000  district  staff  will
request quotes from all of the awarded vendors and will award the project to the
vendor with the lowest responsive, responsible written quote.

For projects $200,000 and over, a separate formal solicitation will be issued.

Contract Term
The initial contract term shall commence September 24, 2025, and will continue
through September 23, 2028, with one (1) optional two (2) year renewal.

Recommendation
It  is  the  recommendation  of  Susan  Hann,  P.E.,  Assistant  Superintendent  of
Facilities  Services  and David  Lindemann,  Director,  of  Facilities  Planning and
Project Management to approve the attached bid tabulaion to the above-named
vendor(s).

Financial Impact: 
FY Amount Budgeted Fund Cost

Center Project Function Object Program 

 2026
-2029

Variable Varies Varies Varies Varies Varies Varies Varies

Legal Review Required: No Legal Review Date: 

Authority for Action: Board Policy 6320, Florida Administrative Code 6A-1.012

Contact:
Sean Hynes, Director of Procurement& Distribution ext. 11641
Rachad T. Wilson, Chief Operating Officer, ext. 11229
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The School Board of Brevard County, Florida

Procurement & Distribution Services
Sean Hynes, Director

2700 JUDGE FRAN JAMIESON WAY, VIERA, FL 32940
(321) 633-1000 Ext: 11645

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD                    
Invitation To Bid - Window Tinting & Graphic Lamination Services
Page 1

NOTICE OF INTENDED DECISION 
ITB No. 25-0767-B-HD

Window Tinting & Graphic Lamination Services

Friday, August 15, 2025

Procurement Services hereby notifies all firms of an intended decision regarding the award of the above-mentioned 
solicitation to:

B2K12 Branding Solutions LLC
Carolina Premier Window Films, Inc.
JAG Window Tinting, Inc.
Suncoast Window Films
Wongsinee Kurtz d/b/a Pro Tint of Florida

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond 
or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings 
under chapter 120, Florida Statutes.

Please contact Heidi Dotson at dotson.heidi@brevardschools.org if you should have any questions. Thank you for 
your continued interest in The School Board of Brevard County, Florida.



Line Item Description Unit of MeasureUnit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1.a

Level 1-Standard Hours: Monday - 
Friday, 6:00 AM to 6:00 (Labor + 
materials) Sq. Ft. $11.00 No Bid $20.00 No Bid $8.00 $19.75

1.b

Level 1-Non-Standard Hours: 
Monday - Friday, Saturdays,
Sundays and Holidays 6:01 PM to 
5:59 AM
Installation cost per square foot 
(Labor + materials) Sq. Ft. $15.00 No Bid $50.00 No Bid $12.00 $19.75

2.a

Level 2-Standard Hours: Monday - 
Friday, 6:00 AM to 6:00 (Labor + 
materials) Sq. Ft. $12.50 No Bid $20.00 No Bid $10.00 $19.75

2.b

Level 2-Non-Standard Hours: 
Monday - Friday, Saturdays,
Sundays and Holidays 6:01 PM to 
5:59 AM
Installation cost per square foot 
(Labor + materials) Sq. Ft. $16.50 No Bid $60.00 No Bid $12.00 $19.75

3.a

Level 3-Standard Hours: Monday - 
Friday, 6:00 AM to 6:00 (Labor + 
materials) Sq. Ft. $14.00 No Bid $20.00 No Bid $10.00 $19.75

3.b

Level 3-Non-Standard Hours: 
Monday - Friday, Saturdays,
Sundays and Holidays 6:01 PM to 
5:59 AM
Installation cost per square foot 
(Labor + materials) Sq. Ft. $18.00 No Bid $100.00 No Bid $12.00 $59.00

Doral Digital 
Reprographics 
& Marketing

JAG Window 
Tinting Inc

ITB # 25-0767-B-HD Window Tinting & Graphic Lamination Services

Suncoast 
Window Films

Wongsinee 
Kurtz d/b/a 
ProTint of 
Florida

Pricing Sheet # 1 for Window Tinting that INCLUDES Graphic 
Lamination Services

B2K12 
Branding 
Solutions LLC

Carolina 
Premier 
Window 
Films,Inc



4

Removal of Window Film, if existing; 
Level 1, Level 2, or Level 3; Standard 
Hours or Non-Standard hours Sq. Ft. $3.00 $3.50 $15.00 No Bid $2.75 $3.50

5

Graphic Design & Setup Fees (if 
included in Sq. Ft. pricing enter 
$0.00) Per Hour $0.00 No Bid $75.00 No Bid $55.00 No Bid

Line Item Description Unit of MeasureUnit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

6.a

Level 1-Standard Hours: Monday - 
Friday, 6:00 AM to 6:00 (Labor + 
materials) Sq. Ft. $9.50 $6.15 $19.00 $11.00 $7.00 $6.00

6.b

Level 1-Non-Standard Hours: 
Monday - Friday, Saturdays,
Sundays and Holidays 6:01 PM to 
5:59 AM
Installation cost per square foot 
(Labor + materials) Sq. Ft. $13.50 $7.00 $50.00 $15.00 $9.00 $12.50

7.a

Level 2-Standard Hours: Monday - 
Friday, 6:00 AM to 6:00 (Labor + 
materials) Sq. Ft. $11.00 $6.35 $19.00 $12.00 $7.00 $6.50

7.b

Level 2-Non-Standard Hours: 
Monday - Friday, Saturdays,
Sundays and Holidays 6:01 PM to 
5:59 AM
Installation cost per square foot 
(Labor + materials) Sq. Ft. $15.00 $7.10 $60.00 $16.00 $9.00 $13.50

8.a

Level 3-Standard Hours: Monday - 
Friday, 6:00 AM to 6:00 (Labor + 
materials) Sq. Ft. $12.00 $6.65 $19.00 $13.00 $7.00 $8.50

Wongsinee 
Kurtz d/b/a 
ProTint of 
Florida 

Suncoast 
Window FilmsPricing Sheet # 2 for Window Tinting Services 

B2K12 
Branding 
Solutions LLC

Carolina 
Premier 
Window 
Films,Inc

Doral Digital 
Reprographics 
& Marketing

JAG Window 
Tinting Inc



8.b

Level 3-Non-Standard Hours: 
Monday - Friday, Saturdays,
Sundays and Holidays 6:01 PM to 
5:59 AM
Installation cost per square foot 
(Labor + materials) Sq. Ft. $16.00 $7.50 $100.00 $17.00 $9.00 $59.00

9

Removal of Window Film, if existing; 
Level 1, Level 2, or Level 3; Standard 
Hours or Non-Standard hours Sq. Ft. $2.00 $3.50 $15.00 $3.00 $2.75 $3.50

B2K12 
Branding 
Solutions LLC

Carolina 
Premier 
Window 
Films,Inc

Doral Digital 
Reprographics 
& Marketing

JAG Window 
Tinting Inc

Suncoast 
Window Films

Wongsinee 
Kurtz d/b/a 
ProTint of 
Florida

Description Unit of Measure Percentage Percentage Percentage Percentage Percentage Percentageg
Markup for 
Rental 
Equipment 
(10% 
Maximum) rate 10.% 5.% 10.% 5.% 10.% 7.%
Markup of 
Materials, 
including 
Window Film 
(10% 
Maximum) rate 10.% 10.% 10.% 5.% 10.% 7.%
Percentage 
Markup for 
Subcontracted 
Services (10% 
Maximum)  rate 10.% 10.% 10.% 5.% 10.% 7.%

Awarded Respondents

Pricing Sheet # 3 for Allowable Markup Percentages 
Window Tinting & Graphic Lamination Services


